
January 2025
Global Advocate Prayer Calendar

	 Sunday	 Monday	 Tuesday	 Wednesday	 Thursday	 Friday	 Saturday
1  New Years Day! 
Join in prayer for 
strength and renewed 
vision for all our GR 
missionaries and 
field leaders as we 
begin a new year.

2  Ask the Lord to 
guide the CGGC 
Executive Director 
Lance Finley 
throughout 2025 as he 
juggles many concerns 
and responsibilities.

3  Happy birthday, Dr. 
John Costa! Support 
him in prayer as he 
leads the Bangladesh 
mission. 

4  Have faith that 
the ACTS teams in 
2025 will provide 
opportunities to 
serve those in 
need and provide 
encouragement for all 
participating.

5  Join together in 
prayer for Travis 
Bodden as he leads 
the Midwest Region 
that the Lord will 
provide clarity and 
discernment in 2025.

6  Pray for Victor 
Montalvo as travels to 
the Latino fields and 
builds relationships 
with the leaders and 
churches.

7  Uplift in prayer the 
Haiti Conference in 
2025 as the pastors 
work towards keeping 
their members 
safe while meeting 
regularly.

8  Intercede on behalf 
of the people of 
Mexico to grow in 
Christ-like character. 
Praise God for new 
ministry expansion!

9  Be in prayer for 
all fields as they deal 
with government 
regulations. This 
is required for 
transferring funds and 
maintaining integrity.

10  Happy birthday, 
India Field Leader 
Samir Singha! Pray 
for grace as he juggles 
so many government 
requirements for the 
Mission.

11  Trust the Lord to 
provide ample support 
for the International 
Field Leaders who 
oversee ten Global 
Reach fields.

12 Pray for peace 
and order to prevail 
throughout all of Haiti 
in 2025 and safety 
for our pastors and 
leaders.

13  Lift up in prayer 
the people of the 
Dominican Republic. 
Pray for faithfulness 
and to stand firm in 
God’s truth.

14  Intercede for 
clear vision and 
discernment as Rod & 
Mila Ayers coordinate 
the Sister Church & 
School ministry for 
Project Help-Haiti.

15  Happy Birthday 
Dave Kapaku! 
Pray for wisdom 
as he continues to 
assist with post-fire 
rebuilding. 

16  Cover the Global 
Reach Commission 
in prayer as they meet 
throughout 2025.

17  Ask God for 
stamina and wisdom 
for Victor Montalvo 
as he leads the 
international Latino 
fields.

18  Praise God for 
Pastor Phil Scott, 
Director of the 
Allegheny Regional 
Conference.

19  Remember in 
prayer the people 
of Nicaragua. Pray 
that they experience 
increased love and 
encouragement.

20  Uplift the USA 
President and other 
elected leaders. Ask 
the Holy Spirit to 
direct them in a way 
that brings all glory 
and honor to God.

21  Unite in prayer 
for the Allegheny 
Region Conference. 
Trust that the 
Lord will provide 
encouragement 
through 2025.

22  Thank God 
for Ryan & Karla 
Myers who serve as 
Mission Advancement 
Volunteers.

23  Trust the Lord to 
provide for the people 
of Kenya. Pray for 
mercy and comfort.

24  Unite in prayer 
for David Odegard, 
CGGC President 
and Great Lakes 
Conference Director.

25  Seek spiritual 
growth and protection 
for Jacob & Haley 
Day as they minister 
in Gamerco.

26  Remember in 
prayer Pastors Denis 
Droicin as he leads 
Project Help in Haiti 
as Liasion.

27  Praise God for 
John and Toni 
Thumma and their 
faithful service at our 
Southwest field.

28  Lift up in prayer 
Jeff & Julie Burns 
who serve as Mission 
Advancement 
volunteers and serve 
on the Global Reach 
Commission. 

29  Remember in 
prayer the Eastern 
Regional Conference 
and Director Nathan 
Buck. Call upon the 
Lord for wisdom and 
unity in 2025.

30  Ask the Holy 
Spirit to encourage 
and guide pastor 
Ernesto Nunes as he 
shepherds the church 
in Brazil.

31  Appeal to the Lord 
for Director Tim 
Welsh as he leads the 
CA Eldership. Ask for 
God’s blessings and 
protection.



February 2025
Global Advocate Prayer Calendar

	 Sunday	 Monday	 Tuesday	 Wednesday	 Thursday	 Friday	 Saturday
1  Call on God’s 
protection for the 
churches in Mexico. 
“For our struggle is 
not against flesh and 
blood...” (Eph. 6:12).

2  Uplift the Project 
Help Executive 
Team as they meet 
throughout 2025 to 
oversee the ministry 
in Haiti.

3  Appeal to the Lord 
for Jacob & Haley 
Day as they prepare 
for mission teams in 
2025.

4  Pray for clear 
knowledge of God’s 
will for each of the 
fields and wisdom so 
GR Director Travis 
Helm can advise 
accordingly.

5  Ask God to 
continue blessing 
ministry partnerships 
between the USA 
and the Dominican 
Republic.

6  Lift up the leaders 
who are receiving 
training through 
Winebrenner 
Seminary in Kenya. 

7  Request the Lord’s 
director and guidance 
for Rod & Mila 
Ayers as they seek to 
minister in Haiti.

8  Pray for the 
ministry in Argentina 
being led by Pastor 
Maria Grigioni, and 
for her radio ministry 
to reach thousands!

9  Appeal for ongoing 
protection and good 
health for Pastor 
German & Silvia 
Baquedano as they 
serve faithfully in 
Nicaragua.

10  Happy birthday 
Elli Crabtree! Ask 
the Lord to bless her 
with health and joy in 
Udon Thani, Thailand.

11  Praise God for 
Pastor Kendall 
Hughes, Director of 
the Western Regional 
Conference.

12  Lift up in Prayer 
Global Reach Director 
Travis Helm to trust 
the Lord for wisdom 
and discernment as 
he works with Field 
leaders.

13  Intercede for 
the churches in Sao 
Paulo, Brazil, as they 
continue to struggle 
from the pandemic 
shutdowns.

14  Intercede for the 
strengthening of 
marriage, that the 
Holy Spirit would 
give each one grace to 
love his or her spouse 
unconditionally.

15  Pray for the 
growing ministry 
of the Nicaragua 
Conference during 
political tensions.

16  Pray for the many 
children who seek 
education in India, 
and for the ministries 
to provide it.

17  Pray for peace 
and favor with 
governments of India 
and Bangladesh for 
our Missions there.

18  Pray that many 
will step out in faith 
to serve on the ACTS 
Teams being sent this 
year.

19  Pray for future 
missionaries and 
leaders in our 
Southwest field as 
the Thumma’s pray 
for God to raise up 
leaders in Hooghan 
Nizhoni.

20 Happy birthday 
Kenda Kapaku! She 
and David serve at 
the Kahana Open 
Door Church in Maui. 
Praise God for their 
leadership.

21  Pray for the Haiti 
government leaders 
to begin to form again 
and actively lead with 
integrity. 

22  Praise God for 
Dr. John Costa’s 
leadership and 
commitment to 
provide medical 
ministry in 
Khanjanpur and 
Bogra, Bangladesh.

23  Pray for 
University of Findlay 
Campus Ministries 
and protection of their 
leadership.

24  Seek the Lord’s 
protective and 
peaceful hand to 
settle over Chaplain 
Matthew Shenton 
as he ministers to 
military personnel 
and families.

25  Praise God 
for Pastor Travis 
Bodden, Director 
of the Midwestern 
Regional 
Conference.

26 Pray for Pastor 
Denis our PHH 
Liaison as he helps 
guide the Haitian 
conference pastors 
and communicates 
with GR Director 
Travis Helm.

27  Join together in 
prayer for Bryan 
& Katie Crabtree 
as they reach out 
to their neighbors 
in Udon Thani, 
Thailand.

28  Intercede for the 
pastor and leaders 
of your church. 
Ask that the Lord 
provide knowledge 
and discernment.



March 2025
Global Advocate Prayer Calendar

	 Sunday	 Monday	 Tuesday	 Wednesday	 Thursday	 Friday	 Saturday
30  Pray for India’s 
Mission Children 
that they would 
continue to grow in 
fear, knowledge, and 
love of the Lord.

31  Thank God for 
the ministry of Dave 
& Kenda Kapaku. 
Petition to God for 
right words and 
understanding as they 
minister.

1  Seek God’s wisdom 
for the leaders of the 
Mexico Conference 
and Pastor Victor 
Montalvo who 
provides counsel.

2  Ask the Lord to 
bless Pastor Denis 
Droicin in Haiti as he 
provides a connection 
between the Haiti 
Conference and 
Project Help.

3  Pray for unity 
between churches: 
“they will hear My 
voice; they will 
become one flock with 
one Shepherd” (John 
10:16).

4  Happy Birthday 
Haley Day! Praise 
God for her as she 
continues to serve 
Him in the Southwest.

5  Bless the leaders of 
the CGWM as they 
minister to women 
at the upcoming 
Flourish Conference, 
in Findlay, OH.

6  Godly marriages 
are of critical 
importance for 
every community 
and nation. Pray for 
married people to be 
faithful and serve the 
Lord together.

7  As you interact 
with businesses 
today, pray for God to 
bless them and look 
for opportunities to 
honor Christ.

8  Pray for Pastor 
Joseph Mwaura as 
he leads the Voice of 
the Gospel ministry 
in Kenya. Ask God to 
raise up godly leaders!

9 Lift up Dr. John 
Costa in Bangladesh 
as he visits remote 
areas and encourages 
the staff and village 
communities.

(Daylight Saving Time Begins)

10  Pray for the ACTS 
Teams and those 
making decisions to 
apply as deadlines 
approach. Pray 
for life-changing 
opportunities to be 
seized!

11  Intercede for the 
CGGC Administra-
tive Council as they 
continue their meet-
ing today. Pray for the 
Holy Spirit to guide in 
all decisions made for 
God’s glory!

12  Pray for India 
field director, Samir 
Singha as he ministers 
to families and that he 
would be an example 
of Christ’s love.

13  Remember to pray 
for your neighbors 
who do not know the 
Lord and ask God to 
provide opportunities 
to befriend them and 
show Jesus’ love.

14  Happy 
Anniversary, Rod & 
Mila Ayers! Thank 
God and ask Him to 
bless Rod & Mila’s 
work with Sister 
Churches and Schools.

15  Pray that 
international guests 
(tourists, students, 
and businesspeople) 
will be warmly 
welcomed and see 
Christ reflected by 
Christians.

16  Lift up in prayer 
Bryan & Katie 
Crabtree as they serve 
as missionaries in 
Thailand while raising 
their two daughters 
and infant son.

17  Pray for Travis 
Helm & Victor 
Montalvo as they 
work together to 
oversee the Latino 
fields.

18  Mondays often are 
“days off ” for pastors. 
Pray for YOUR 
pastor today to be 
blessed with peace 
and encourage them 
as they minister.

19  Christ is our peace 
(Eph. 2:14). Pray for 
the broken relation-
ships in your church 
and community and 
seek to encourage 
them to be open to the 
Holy Spirit.

20  Call on the Lord’s 
blessing for Pastor 
Ernesto Nunes and 
the Brazil Conference.

21  Intercede for your 
local homeless shelter 
and learn how you can 
help their ministry 
through volunteering 
and financial support.

22  Happy birthday, 
Toni Thumma! Pray 
for her health as 
she serves alongside 
John in ministry at 
Hooghan Nizhoni.

23  Pray for the many 
young people who are 
wandering far to come 
back. Welcome them!

24  Celebrate our King 
Jesus on this Palm 
Sunday! Prepare for 
Holy Week as we 
acclaim the King of 
kings and Lord of 
lords. “Blessed be the 
name of the Lord!”

25  Intercede for the 
Global Reach Com-
mission as they meet 
bimonthly to seek 
God’s guidance in all 
decisions made. 

26  God cares for the 
orphans (Ps. 10:18). 
Pray for godly parents 
to adopt children in 
desperate need of a 
home.

27  Support Samir 
& Madhumita 
Singha in prayer on 
this anniversary of 
Charusheela’s birth. 
May Christ comfort 
them in their grief.

28  There are many 
disabled people who 
struggle to make 
it every day. Pray 
for them to receive 
practical help, and 
to know they are not 
alone.

29  Pray for Army 
Chaplain Byron 
Denman and his 
family as they 
minister.


